
The Burning Man Chronicles

- On-site tales of debauchery and hedonism combined with huge scoops of self-aggrandizing, 
egotistical arrogance and delusional hubris
- “We are so cool” is what the Burners are thinking; but “douchebags” is what the world sees

Burning Man is a giant sex city enhanced by drugs and Silicon 
Valley Look-At-Me narcissism

Site will be dedicated to racism, misogyny, sexual objectification of women, drugs and yuppie rich-boy
narcissism

The nearly all white rich boy cult camp is moving to Fly Ranch where it can permanently force naive 
young women to dress like sluts, continue to lock out all blacks, take even more drugs and worship the 
golden cow of selfies and look-at-me narcissists.

What do Burning Man, Scientology, Jim Jones, and the Moonies have in common? They are all cults.

Why is Burning Man a “Black-Free Zone”: Because it is the worst of Silicon Valley

- Arrogance, self-aggrandizing, Elon Musk and racism all go together like Silicon Valley and 
well, Silicon Valley.

- Burning Man is finally busted for what it is: A White Boy fantasy world of tits, cash and yuppie 
privilege

- No blacks at Burning Man because “Blacks Don’t Camp” say organizers. “Blacks don’t like it 
outside. It scares them” . KKK wants a huge tent there next year.

- Silicon Valley never hires Blacks or let’s them live in Silicon Valley. Burning Man: Same Thing

Burning Man founder Larry Harvey has countered criticism of the lack of racial diversity at the festival
by saying that part of the reason there are so few black attendees (known as burners) is that “I don’t 
think black folks like to camp as much as white folks”.

In an interview with the Guardian, Harvey vowed that “we’re not going to set racial quotas”, defended 
the presence of rich Silicon Valley executives at the festival, and said he will personally go undercover 
this week to investigate the luxurious camps of ultra-wealthy tech bosses said by the New York Times 
to boast chefs, air conditioning and servants.

According to the most recent Black Rock city census, complied yearly by a team of academic 
demographers and anthropologists to determine the makeup of the festival, 87% of burners identified as
white; 6% identified as Hispanic, 6% as Asian, and 2% as Native Americans (figures rounded) – on the 
latter of whose ancestral lands the event occurs. The smallest demographic of burners – 1.3% – 
identified as black. According to the census, which also measures income, this means that the 
temporary city is home to twice as many people who earn $300,000 a year as it is to black people. 

http://www.nytimes.com/2014/08/21/fashion/at-burning-man-the-tech-elite-one-up-one-another.html?_r=0
https://blackrockcitycensus.wordpress.com/page/2/
https://blackrockcitycensus.wordpress.com/page/2/
https://blackrockcitycensus.wordpress.com/


The art of Burning Man: skeletons, temples and 
flaming Tetris
Besides pounding techno and swirling dust, the desert festival is home to a host of spectacular art 
installations. Here are some of the best 
Read more 

So given that the first of the festival’s 10 principles is “radical inclusion”, what does it mean that the 
festival’s vision of a utopian society is 90% white?

“This has never been, imagined by us, as a utopian society,” Harvey answered. “I’ll believe in utopia 
when I meet my first perfect person, and this community is made up of 70,000 imperfect persons.

“That being the case,” he continued, “I think it’s a little much to expect the organisation to solve the 
problem of racial parity. We do see a fast-increasing influx of Asians, black folks. I actually see black 
folks out here, unlike some of our liberal critics.” 

Dan Drahos dances at the Robot Heart during the morning hours at Burning Man. Photograph: Jim 
Urquhart/Reuters 

http://burningman.org/culture/philosophical-center/10-principles/


Black burners are not an abstract concept for Harvey: “My family is half black,” he said. “I see black 
people! And they’re here. Though I got a lot of criticism for once saying, ‘Well I don’t think black 
people like to camp’.” Harvey’s comment drew nervous laughter from other Burning Man staff and 
members of international media at a press conference before the Guardian’s interview. “There are some
historic reasons for that, especially in the United States.”

Asked later to expand on this, Harvey told the Guardian: “Remember a group that was enslaved and 
made to work. Slavishly, you know in the fields. This goes all the way back to the Caribbean scene, 
when the average life of a slave in the fields was very short. And, so, there’s that background, that 
agrarian poverty associated with things. Maybe your first move isn’t to go camping. Seriously.” 
Burning Man’s Marcia Crosby disagrees. Many Burning Man staff think that the whole thing is just 
about profits and ego exposure now.

The rest of the year, Harvey lives in the historically black Fillmore neighborhood of San Francisco. 
“My wife is from Jamaica. My ex-wife. My stepchildren – and then there’s my son. So, it’s a biracial 
family. “In my neighbourhood,” he added, “the thing to do was to get a good-looking car, and people 
would sit on stoops, and you’d stop your car in the middle of the street and you’d start talking. That 
was society. And that involved a lot of display, a lot of dress, a lot of attention to style. But the idea of 
getting down in the dirt? Not particularly popular.”

“You think I am full of crap?” Harvey asked the Guardian. Not entirely: his responses are not entirely 
out of line with what some (though not all) black burners have told me.Participants gather to watch the 
flames from the art car El Popo Mechanico during Burning Man. Photograph: Jim Urquhart/Reuters 

But Harvey had harsh words for a diversity consultant the organisation hired who “was black, and 
lesbian, and she had a niche in the nonprofit world, because they’re always trying to check off those 
boxes, in terms of quotas, so they can say [they are diverse].“At a certain point, she made a speech 
which was pro forma, which I didn’t know was the speech she always made, about the racial question. I
said ‘Well, I don’t think black folks like to camp as much as white folks!’ And she said ‘You son of a 
bitch!’ And then there was a guy, who did a sort of white man shuffle in response, and said,” – Harvey 
dropped his voice – “‘We understand.’”



Afterwards, Harvey went to the consultant. “I took it seriously, and I said, ‘Listen. You’ve got to have 
connections with all these black arts or community groups. And I will go anywhere and talk to anyone 
you direct me to.’ She never got back to me. And it’s only later I realised I had never seen her with a 
black person. She lived in a white nonprofit world. She didn’t really represent the black community. 
She wasn’t asking us to do anything. It was just this pose she had to strike.”

Harvey believes that more black people will come to Burning Man, following his family’s example. “I 
have contributed. Because, my stepson and my stepdaughter and my ex-wife are here.” 

Early in Burning Man’s history, Harvey was upset to hear about a black burner who felt isolated. “I 
know how she felt. My son is biracial, if that term makes any sense, but he’s considered black because 
it’s a touch of the brush [which] brands you black anywhere. So I’ve encountered that, in reactions to 
my family.” His stepson, he says, was arrested in Marin County, the wealthy suburban county north of 
the Golden Gate bridge “more than once, where he lived, of DWB: which is driving while black. 
[White people] seem to think if you drive past their homes, you’re reducing their property values, and 
the cops act like they’re some kind of mall security force. It’s pretty racist.”

Such experiences have confirmed Harvey’s disdain for “white liberal circles,” who he says preach 
diversity while calling the cops on someone like his son. “Don’t tell me all this chest-thumping about 
the racial question is without hypocrisy.” Meanwhile he is defensive about allegations of Burning Man 
and wealth – both that of the organisation, and of its campers: “We’re not going to judge people in 
terms of the amount of wealth they bring to the event.” He downplayed how much profit the festival 
makes, and denied the timing (though not interest) of a potential purchase of nearby land for future 
festivals recently reported by New York magazine. He said Silicon Valley “had always been well 
represented” at Burning Man, and dismissed recent stories about tech titans here as “the story of the 
day”.

Participants compete in the Carnival of Death race. Photograph: Jim Urquhart/Reuters 

Harvey said the problem with luxurious “plug and play camps” was not that they were made of wealthy
people, but that they were violating Burning Man’s community spirit as gated communities with no 
connection to their neighbors. He said reforms had been instigated, and that he was personally going 
undercover to investigate all of those camps to see if a stranger was welcomed. But if he’s going to 
personally look at the role of the super-wealthy, how aggressively to address race and Burning Man? 
Harvey said an attempt to conjure appropriate amount of racial diversity involving quotas “in itself 
would be an act of condescension, wouldn’t it?”

http://nymag.com/daily/intelligencer/2015/08/will-burning-man-become-a-permanent-community.html


(PHOTO: The women at Burning Man allow strangers to simply walk up to them and grab their boobs)

“We’re not going to set up a Marxist state,” he said. “We see culture as a self-organising thing. And 
we’re unwilling to impose and mandate behavior from the outside, we want to generate change from 
the inside.”

Change from the inside of a population that is disproportionately white compared to the demographics 
of Nevada, the United States, and the globe? “I hope I haven’t said anything too incendiary,” Harvey 
concluded.

Horrific Tragedy at Burning man 2016; Over 40,000 
attendees infected with MAA

Thanks to the global connection and transparency afforded by global social media, the vast Playa in the
Nevada desert was, in 2015, soon revealed, by observers, to be ground zero for one of the largest 
infections of MAA in recorded history.

The world is now in shock that so many young and naïve participants were struck down in their prime. 
Equally horrifying is the loss of so many senior members of the Burning Man society, who have been 



discovered to be the carriers of MAA.

MAA (Mutually Assisted Asshole-ism) is a terrible disease that was only thought to survive in Silicon 
Valley, Santa Monica and parts of Manhattan. Once afflicted, the weakened delusional state of the 
victims often brings on the secondary affliction of Repercussive MR (Massive Rationalization).
The giant Burning Man statue was discovered to, most likely, be Scientology’s Zenu. The entire 
Burning Man event was, essentially Scientology as Disneyland.

For all of the drug abuse, zen date rape, sexually exploitive costumes and cultish nonsense, nothing can
top the participants willingness to rationalize that they are right and others are not cool enough to 
recognize their higher state of awareness.
The Burners will endlessly self-congratulate each other and go on TED talk, after TED talk to mutually
glorify each of the others in their closed group of self glory. Burners hate those people who don’t 
recognize their personal wonderfulness. They are like a Texas banker going on about inter-racial 
marriage. Anybody who does not have “the look” and the reverence for the Rationalizations is a 
“hostile thinker” and must be shunned.

In the most twisted of Dichotomies, on the way to their “Empowered Women” workshop camp tent 
fireworks talk; Playa women offer sex and dress in “F*ck Me” outfits but scream when their pictures of
sexual whoreish-ness are publicized. 





The Toxic bug-infested, radiation-infused, dust-ridden sex den 
that is Burning Man

By Marcia Coyote

The nearly all-white Silicon Valley hedonism party for the privileged fraternity house-raised male is 
now going to be 24/7, all year long.

Burning Man has bought nearly 7000 acres of land at Fly Ranch for a non-stop party of sin, 
debauchery, scantily clad women, drug-taking and the worship of giant commercially contracted idols.

Burning Man pays prop designers to make giant versions of everything from chairs, to torsos to toilets, 
ideally in a manner which will involve superficial irony for the artistically challenged. The hope is that 
the drugged up revelers will worship the giant idols and pay their hundreds of dollars to the “Burning 
Man Foundation” instead of the church collection plate. They hold their event in the back-winds and 
waste debris of the test beds of the most deadly weapons on Earth. Nobody at Burning Man stops to 
think about the fact that all of the weapons test centers are right over the hill. All of that dust they are 
inhaling and absorbing is full of glow-in-the-dark particles, nerve agents and weird tactical 
whatchamacallits. 

The Catholic Church, Muslims, Buddhists, Protestants, Southern Christian Baptists, and most sane 
people, seem to have a problem with the cultish religion that Burning Man has become. Burning Man 
pretends to be an “art festival” while, in fact, it is now a commercialized religion preying on naive 
young girls and over-privileged Brock Turner yuppie kids from Stanford.

Aside from all of the date rapes, utter lack of any other skin color, but white, insane money show-off-
ing, and self-aggrandizing narcissism of the selfie-generation gone mad; Burning Man is just the worst 
that society has to offer. It is entirely an insiders romp through the most hideous forms of self-
indulgence you can possibly imagine. 



Got flat abs, a deep tanning salon spray-on and plastic boobs and lips? Then you get to have sex with a 
different hottie every few hours on the Playa. Are you sporting some love handles or a bit-o-flab? Then 
“get outta here”. Burning Man sex is only for the superficially appointed.

Every single Burning Man organizer will go to great lengths, in a screaming rant of self-righteous 
proclamations, to assure you that “The Man” has nothing to do with sex or drugs because they do not 
want to lose their 501 C 3 non-profit tax evasion status. The reality is that Burning Man is the closest 
thing to Sodom and Gomorrah on Earth. 

Aside from the exclusion of Blacks and poor people, Burning Man has the most incest-oriented culture 
around. If you don’t have dread-locks, sun-fried skin, tattoos, dress in 20 layers of “free trade” fabric, 
and manifest a total disdain for monogamy then you will not be allowed to get near the inner circle. All 
of the people that work on Burning Man only have sex with each other. They practice the free-love 
hippie culture as if it was July 6th, 1965. Their bible is the “Mad Max” movie franchise and few of them
seem to believe that Mad Max is not a documentary film series.

If you question them or “The Man” you will be ostracized and shunned as if you asked the Jewish 
Prime Minister: “What’s so bad about Palestinians?”

The stoned, everything-is-wonderful, self-obsessed, glaze-eyed, cult-like stare of every seasoned 
Burner is terrible to behold. Some of the most misogynistic, female-abusive occurrences in America 
have taken place at Burning Man. Aside from the drugged out date-rapes, which Burning Man PR 
agents go to great lengths to keep out of the news, there are other SJW horrors. A number of attending 
males have published epic photographic documentation of all of the Burning Man women letting 
strange men squeeze their breasts. 

Another posted all of his sex conquests over a 3 day period in the Playa. It turns out women in the 
desert, loaded up on ecstasy and pot, rarely say “no”. The number of people who got AIDS and 
Syphilis at Burning Man is reaching record-breaking numbers.

Nobody can evade taxes like The Burning Man. What with Panama Papers, you might think this would 
be an issue. Tax free ranches sound good about now, too. I have been at Burning Man many times and 
I, and my friends, have seen the twisted culture of it get more and more twisted every year. Now, it is 
simply a for-profit cult.

Does Burning Man need an intervention? Should a group of savvy citizens go down to their Mission 
District headquarters in San Francisco and have a word with them? Should the Congress investigate 
them? Congressman Burton went down to have a word with a similar organization after word got out 
that they were drinking the Kool Aid too much. That didn’t work out so well for the poor Congressman 
or the followers of the Jim Jones cult, who also went off and built their own big ranch out in the sticks.



(PHOTO: The “Ladies” of Burning Man” Let Strangers Grab Their Breasts)

Topics: Burning Man, Fly Ranch, The Catholic Church, Muslims, Buddhists, Protestants, Southern 
Christian Baptists, Burning Man date rape, Burning man rapes, Brock Turner rapes, Burning Man bugs,
Burning Man Playa, Burning Man Fly Ranch, Burning Man investigation, Burning Man Tax Evasion, 
Panama papers, burning man taxes, burning man tax investigation, jim jones cult, elon musk cult, 


